Court of

FORM OF ORDER SHEET

Appeal No. ‘ 1950/2023

~Date of order
proceedings

25/09/2023

Order or other proceedings with signature of judge

s; j ) e
The  appeal of Mr. Mubhammad Riaz presented

today by Mr. Noor Muhammad Khattak Advocate. 1t s fixed

for preliminary hearing before Single Beneh at Peshawar on

Ry the order of Chairmnn

——

REGISTRAR

mmr vam o avimm aempe e tesamemaoo o




BEFORE THE KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA SERVICE TRIBUNAL,

PESHAWAR

APPEAL NO. / 9’3% /2023

MUHAMMAD RIAZ VS THE SECRETARY PUBLIC HEALTH
ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT,

& OTHERS
INDEX
S. NO. DOCUMENTS ANNEXURE PAGE
1 Memo of Appeal with Affidavit | e l _ L/
5 | Copy of the appointment order A 5
Copies of the notifications . B&C _
3. P L-%
. Copies of the decree and D&E
" | transcript Q- /o
- Copies of the Rules and|  rag '
> | notification 1 /- 1Y
Copies of the record H —
6. |-P - | /S- 31
- | Copy of departmental appeal 1 .
/. Py oTcep PP | 3 32 - 33
8. Vakalatnama 3y
Dated: 19-9 -13
APPELLANT
Muhamimad Riaz
THROUGH: £ .
NOOR MUHAMMAD KHATTAK

ADVOCATE SUPREME COURT

/

/




.’\,

BEFORE THE KHYBER PAKHTl_JNKHWA SERVICE TRIBUNAL,

PESHAWAR

APPEAL NO._ / 98 D _ 12023

Mr. Muhammad Riaz, Sub Engineer BPS-12,
Public Health Engineering Division Northern Tribal District at Peshawar.

rerrcrancnnrrnes S, envanen APPELLANT

VERSUS

The Secretary Public Health Engineering Department, Khyber
Pakhtunkhwa, Civil Secretariat, Peshawar.

The Chief Engineer (South) Public Health engineering
Department Khyber Pakhtunkhwa, Peshawar.

The Chief Engineer (Centre) Public Health engineering
Department Khyber Pakhtunkhwa, Peshawar.

The Superintending Engineer PHE Circle Northern Tribal Dlstrlcts
at Peshawar.

Mr. Ijaz Ahmad, Sub Engineer BPS-12, Public Health Engineering
Department Khyber Pakhtunkhwa, Peshawar

crereenasce P RESPONDENTS

APPEAL UNDER _ SECTION-4 OF THE KHYBER
PAKHTUNKHWA SERVICE TRIBUNAL, 1974 AGAINST
THE INACTION OF THE RESPONDENTS BY NOT

CONSIDERING THE APPELLANT FOR PROMOTION TO

THE POST OF ASSISTANT ENGINEER/ SDO BPS-17 IN
QUOTA OF IN-SERVICE GRADUATE AND AGAINST THE
INACTION OF THE APPELLATE AUTHORITY BY NOT

DECIDING THE DEPARTMENTAL APPEAL_OF THE
APPELLANT WITHIN THE STATUTORY PERIOD OF 90

- DAYS.

PRAYER

That on acceptance of the instant service appeal, the
respondents may kindly be directed to consider the

appellant for promotion to the post of Assistant
Engineer/Sub Divisional Officer ‘BPS-17 with all back
benefits. Any other remedy which this august Tribunal
deem fit may also be awarded in favour of the appellant

R/SHEWETH:

ON FACTS:




Vi

‘ ' ' -
, -2
1) That the appellant was appointed against the post of Sub Engineer
BPS-11 now BPS-12 on the recommendation of the Khyber
Pakhtunkhwa Public. Service Commission vide order dated
29/10/2015. That in response the appellant submitted his arrival
report and started performing his duty quite efficiently and upto

the entire satisfaction of his superiors. Copy of the appointment
order is attached as annexure...caesee Cererrenerratasaestses pererans A"

2) That during service-the appellant applied for Study Leave for
perusing BSc Civil Engineering at Igra National University,
Peshawar, accordingly the Study Leave for the period of two years
was sanctioned to the appellant vide notification dated 23/12/2020.
That whereafter extension for further one year was also sanctioned

to the appellant vide notification dated 01/12/2022. Copies of the
notifications are attached as annexure...veeeees erwvurrners "B"” &“C"

3) That after successful completion of the BSc Civil Engineering
Program, the appellant was issued the Degree of Bachelor of
Science & Engineering by the Igra National University on

24/07/2023. Copies of the Degree and transcript are attached as
ANNEXUM.rravuvserarass Cerreeenverarerrnrrerte cvvvaaisead "D" &“E"

4)That as per Rules dated 15/05/2020 and subsequent notification
dated 31/01/2022, the appeliant is entitled for promotion to the
post of AE/SDO BPS-17 on the basis of semorzty cum-fitness and in

light of in-service quota. Copies of the Rules and notification are
attached aE ANNEXUICuurrrevavvrarnsrnanse rareraenns P S R C

5) That appellant while perusing his case for promotlon to the post of
" AE/SDO BPS-17, it was came into the krnowledge of appellant .
through a reliable source that the respondents considering the
junior colleague of the appellant i.e. private respondent No. 4 for

promotion to the post of AE/SDO BPS-17, bemg blue eyed to the .
respondents.

‘6) That the private respondent, who was appointed as Sub Engineer

BPS-12 vide dated 09/03/2017 proceeded on'Extra Ordinary Leave
Without Pay on 23/11/2017 for the period of two years, requested
the respondents for further extension of his EOL for the period of
1 year, so excluded the 3 years period of EOL, the appellant total
service become 2 years, which is less than the period specified for
promotion under the rules (Dearth of more than 3 years). Copies
of the record is attached as aNNEXUre..uueeereess I O WH”

)




‘. _
N ’ -

7) That appellant time and again visited the concerned quarters fo
his promotion, but of no avail. | '

8) That the appellant filed departmental appes! against the inaction
of the respondents by not considering him for promotion to the

- post of AE/SDO BPS-17, but no reply has been received so far.
Copy of departmental appeal is attached as annexure....veres e e o

9) Thét‘ the appellant feeling aggrieved and having no other remedy
filed the instant service appeal on following grounds inter alia.

GROUNDS:

: A- That the inaction of the respondents by considering the
Al : appellant for promotion to the post of AE/SDO BPS-17 is against
Pl the law, facts, norms of natural justice and materials on the
il o record hence not tenable and liable to be set aside.

B- That appellant has not been treated by the respondent

) Department in accordance with law and rules on the subject
noted above and as such the respondents violated Article 4 and
25 of the Constitution of Islamic Republic of Pakistan 1973.

- C- That the respondent départment has'. acted arbitrary and
e malafidely by not considering the appellant for promotion from
due date. ‘

~D- That the treatment meted out to the appellant is clearly based

on discrimination and malafide and as such the respondents
violatedl the principle of natural justice.

E- That respondents violated Article 38(e) of the Constitution of
- Islamic Republic of Pakistan 1973, according to which state is
bound to eliminate disparity in the income and earning of
individuals .including persons in the services of the Federation,

thus in light of the above quoted constitutional provision the .
respondents are duty bound to grant - ante dated

- promotion/notional promotion to the post of promotion to the
post of AE/SDO BPS-17.

‘! A ' |
F-  That according to Section 9 of the Civil servant Act, 1973 read

with Rule 17 of the appointment, promotion and transfer Rules

and Notional promotion policy the appellant is fully entitled for
* the grant of ante dated promotion. o

|
- :




Rl 1 S
s : P , . -
RENES | | , -

i | G- That appe[lant seeks permission to advanca other grounds and
| _proofs at the time of hearing. '
|

It is therefore; most hunably prayed that the appeal of the
appellant may very gramously be accepted as prayed for, please

Dated: 19-9 2.3

~ Mu amma | Riaz
THROUGH:

- NOOR MUHAMMAD KHATTAK
ADVOCATE SUPREME COURT

| UMAR ARGOQ MOMAND
Muﬁ%;{MA/AVUB
E & KHAN D GUL
- ADVOCATES
" AFFIDAVIT |
I, Muhammad Riaz, Sub Engineer BPS-12, Public Health
Engineering Division North ran Tribal District at Peshawar, do hereby
: solemnly affirm that the contents of this Service Appeal are true and

b correct to the best of my knowledge and belief and nothmg has been
concealed from this Honorable Court.

DPO EN




To,
Muhammad Riaz S/0 Taslim Khan !
of Khyber Agency r/o Hostel No.2, Room#24
Govt. College of Technology Kohat Road Peshuwar. .
. Subject: B ENGINEE

OFFICE OF THE CHIE# ENGINEER (SOUTH)
PUBLIC HEALTH ENGIFEERING DEPARTMENT
KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA, PESHAWAR y ﬁ, /

No. !H / E-4 [ ¢#HE,

Dated Peshawar, .‘che_’fl__,/ [o [2015. S -
[ _J

N

ifr

On the recommendations of the Khyber Pakhtunkhi/a -Public Service Commission,

the competent authority is pleased to offer you a post of Sub Englneer (BPS-11) in PHE

Department, subject to the terms and.conditions mentioned below:

!

1) You will get pay at the minimum of BPS-11 Including usyal allowances as
admissible under the rules. You will also be entitled to annual Increrment as per
existing policy. o . .

1))] The above post, for all intents and purposes, shall be within the definition of Civil
Servants, , -

1) You wili- be governed: by the:KHhyber Pakhtunkhwa Civil-Servants Act 1973 and all
the laws applicable to the GiviliServants and Rules framed. there-under, = '

v) You will .initlally be an.probation for a period. of .two years extendable upto three -

years. e e
v)  Your services. : at.any’ -assigning’.any
i of iprobation

reason; b

. ever /en-one: spriorinotice. ol fromse 05

Zoreemonth's pay-in lieu thereof. In case you wish to resign at any time, one

month’s notice shall be necessary or in lleu thereof one ‘month's pay shall be

foillelted.

vi) Your appeintment will be subject to verification of your domicile and testimonial
from the concerned authorities/offices, .

vil)  You will-not.be entitled to any TA/DA on your first appointrment as Sub Engineer.
You will join duty at your own expenses. e .

viil)  You shall produce 3:Medical Certificate of. Fitness from Medical Superintendent,
Police &:Services Hospltal:Peshawar; as required under. the rules. _

ix) You.shall'be liable to serve anywhere In-Khyber Pakhtunikhwa, including FATA.

' If you accept the postion above teftns - and" conditions, you.should report and
submit acceptance on Bond - worth:'Rs.30/- signed and duly attested by the .Qath
Commissioner to the undersigned.to-this -office, ‘within: fourteen (14). days ‘of the recelpt of
this offer of appaintment, for:further pcj:'sﬁl'h“g-A'é{ii‘d'ip"r’éduce_o'rigr!ﬁ'él."ce"f'tlﬁc:ate's- in ‘connection
with your qualification, domicile-and age etc, '

iy

R e

} e ithin stipulated .perlod as

Aty

. “In,;case .of failure df, response to tt_i_'a:' oue_C
mientionéd above, the;offer.shall stand canicelled autamaticaliin

A

, AMTEF ENGINEER (SOUTH)
Endstt: No.1 / E-26 /.PHE, /  Dated 4/ {02015 i

Copy for information is forwarded:to:
1- The Accountant General Khyber Pakhitunkhwa Peshawar,

2- The Chlef Englneer (North) PHE Department Peshaw

3. The Sectlon] Officer: :(Estt) PHED peshawar
No.SO(Estt)/PHED/1-90/2014+15,-dated 27,10.2015.

th rgfetence to his letter

LR =

euséf:leen (SOUTH)

‘ \ @ CamSaqan ::




sovanumm or I(HYBF.R pnan FUNKHWA '
puUBLIC HEAL‘TH 'ENGG: DEFARTMENT v P

Dated Peshawar lhe De§embef -5-.—*-;:-202.0 SR

 d

s e o e T

Mot
Tn pursuanice;of Fnance: ‘Department:

,ienef No. so(mr-u;s 27;1020;9&4& doted 18:12-2020;" he-competent autharity-

1s| pleased to grant study ieave: for o pefiod of tWo- years {on half average pay)

with effect from 31- 10-2020 in favour of Mr. Muhammad RI22, Sub Englneer

(BPS-12) Public Health Engg: Division- Nerthern Tibal Blstricks ot Peshaviar:for
-pursuing B.Sc Cvll Englneer&ng, at; lqra Naﬂcmal Unlvers!lY Pashawar‘ '-,',‘“! er the:
‘provision of FR-64 read withi Appefidix 9-1 {Ay of FRL&SRL il subject to the;
coidition that Inkerrialflocal ‘affangement il be:made by the Adnminlstrative

Department and no conbract employee, will be appointed during s’tUdY Peﬂ"d of
‘the officlal mgcemed

SECRETARY
_PHE'DEPARTMENT

'Jt
{

,SO{FR. -2712020/PH

Copy forwarc}ed to the. Accounmnt Genexal Kleber Pakhmnkhwa Peshawat
for information and necessary achon.

SECTION: OFFlCER (ER)
GOV OF KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA'
HNANCE o&mm AENT

ol | Copy forwarded to the:-

Al 1) Secretary to Govt: of Khyber ‘Pakintunkhwa; Finance Department.
i , 2) Chief Engineer (South) PHE Department Peshawar.
Sy 3) Superiniending Engineer pHE Circle Northern Tribat Districts at

BRI peshawar.

S 4) Executive Engineer PHE Division Northern Tribal Di;trlcts:-at?esh‘éwar..

i 5) Official concerned.

6) PS to Secretary-PHE Depattment Knyber- Pakhmnkhw'jjgﬁhawarj,
7) Office Order |-Personal File: NG

'..'ws .

SECTION 655’ M i
GOVT: OF KHYBER P AKHTUNKHWA
PHE DEPARTMENT

IR 1)




GOVERNMENT or-' KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA
PUBLIC HEALTH ENGG:: LEPARTMENT

No. SO(Em)/PHED/Z—QO/zGlB-lQ ’7' -

Dated Peshawar, the. D..eember 04, 2020

The Secretary to Govt: of Khyber Pakhtunkhv:d,
Finance Department,: Peshawar

Subject:  REQUEST FOR TWQ.Y STUDY LEAVE.
L . : 14
E . . N

€ ' . Co S ’
(i N 1 amvdirected to refer to:the subject roted above.and to enclose
"~ |herewith an application of Mr, Muhanimad Riaz, Sub Engineer (BPS-12) Public
i Health Engg: Division Northern' Tribal Districts:at Peshaivar; fequesting thereln

for the grant of two years study leave -enabling him to -pursue B.Sc..Civil
Engmeering at Iqra National. Unlversity Peshawar This program:has been
commenced from October, 2020. ‘ ;l

2. It is further added’ that the above-named official was- appoanted as
|Sub Engineer on 29-10-2015 and ‘thus the applicant has coipleted: 5-years
. service and has not availed any kind of leave during his service.

. I g :
3. In vuew of the above, it'is requested that necessary sanction to the
grant of two years study leave w. e.f. 31- 10-2020- (@s. per prevalling rules)-may
kindly-be issued'in favour of the: official: concerned.. Al refevarit. doctiments ‘are
enclosed herewith.

) ;:ﬁ(ou;rs{f
| ' secuon . ( 33}3

1{11_9..;%_

ENDST: NO & DATE AS ABOVE:

Copy forwarded for information. to the:-

1. Chief Engineer, (South) PHE. Peshawar w/rto hls ietters No. 18/E-6/PHE
dated 27-10-2020"and No:02/E-6/PHE dated 30-11:2020. o
2. PS to Secretary PHE Department, Khyber Pakhtunkhwa, Peshawar.

|

SECTION OFFICER (ESTT) —




PR L

P i
o'

,u ) e Ty GOVERNMENT OF KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA ’ @-f

\ 2 S (
gi}}'f\{;\\a%i"' PUBLIC HEALTH ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT </
G TS ' - o ' '
P ...-»&\.—-!f'i,, - . l_ D‘ated.f‘eshawar, the December 01, 2022 - 2 -
; ¥ : : ‘ :
NOTIFICATION

No,SO(Estt)/ PHED/1-43/2022: In consuitdtion with Finance Department
leder  NO.SOSR-IV/FD/2-10/2021-22/PHE/Leave dated ~ 25-11-2022, the
_competent authority is pleased to grant extension In study leave (on half average
| pay) for further period of one (01) year with effect from 01-11-2022 to 30-10-
| 2023 in favour of Muhammad Riaz, Sub Engineers (B%-12) Public Health
Engineering Division, Northern Tribal District at Peshawar, to pursue B. Sc Civil
Engineering at lara National University peshawar, under the provision of FR-
'c:—,l-tS“f'/audit ruling read with appendix 9-1 (A) of FR-1 & SR-1 & 11, subject to the
Fondition that internal/local arrangement will be made by the Administrative
Department and no contract employee wiil be appolnted dufring leave period of
the official concerned. o b '

|

SECRETARY TO | i
GOVT: OF KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA
PHE DEPARTMENT, PESHAWAR

Endst: NO.SOSR-IVIFD/Z-10/2021-22[PHE/L€8V3 D'éied: 2? J A3 [ 2022
Copy forwarded to the Accountant General, " Kb akhtunkhwa

peshawar for information and necessary action.

I E ey
R LA S

SECTION SR-1V)

GOVT: OF KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA

* FINANCE DEPARTMENT
Endst: No.SO{Estt]l]PHED/l-ctB/2022 . pated Peshawar, December 01, 2022

1
.

Copy forwarded to the:

1) Chief Engineer (Center) PHE Khyber pakhtunkhwa Peshawar w/r to his
letters No.10/CE-7/PHE(C) dated 14-10-2022
2) Superintending Engineer PHE Circle Khyber.
3) Executive Engineer PHE Division Khyber.
4) District Accounts Officer Khyber. .-
5) PS to Secretary PHE Department Khyber pakhtunkhwa Pe
6) Officials concerned. | J
7) Office Order / Personal Flle.

hawar.

§

(SHER AZAM KHAN)
SECTION OFFICER (ESTT)

B _ ' Qannnnd yinith Clas -




N4

i‘\cglstmtwn o, 091-20y'7076 ' |7, e ' Serial £0.003939. A

CS CamScann 4

35@33@ ﬁal’tmml @mnmﬁlt?

Sislamlt ﬂ&epuhllt nf ilElaklstan

;{:ﬁul)ammab 3&1&; 5;3»3/0 ’(Easlun lr»l)an

1!3&5 Satlstactnrlly tuItnIIeD al[ requuenwntﬁ fur ﬂ)f. ZBegree nf
iﬁad)elnr nf Eauzn:e m umL(Cngnmermg

mth ljas tbmefure been ahmttteb to tI)e Eegwe ol 03 3’"'2”2023

n te tegtinmony mbereof tbl§ Eem ee !)ns Imcn tSSucI: uu’oer autbou;.cb signatures and

"@ftmal seal of tl)e ﬂ%lmbmsltp, @lben ﬂ)lS uu__%*fl__mnp of ﬂl’ - 20_23

= U
\thance[[m R




PA -
GEO!NFDRMATI

>, GRVEYIN gngORCED CONCREI EDES!GN-I! .

ANTSTY'S ucrunf.ANA!.Ysls SOFTWARE APHMON(LAB)

- MECHANICS | ofsouns-l ~STEEL smucrunzs i -
G smwevmﬁ WATER SUFFLY. a«umﬁms

FINAL YEAR PROECT(RART:D)
.L_;wnnmmvmowmk MANA
c::omroms :
NG e
omammo»‘omﬂwam .‘;
PROJECT mmmomnmmmanum :

NUME‘UCALANM-YS!S .
. CONSTRUCTION ENGINEERING
S VI BJGINEER!NG DRAWING A

ENG!N‘EF.RD‘G SHRVEYD!G (LAB)

TR RPN RICAPE B

-uvl:

.S?R(.\G-)l

‘erDm:cnmuS(ua P B

STRUCTURALANALYSISd - = __ml.mnmom (PART-LI) - o I

ADVANCED snam;mmslmma (um) {RRIGATION ENGINEERING ” 3 .

CFLUID MECHANICS: ', . JNTRO TO STRUCTURAL DYNAMICS & mmqu»:z m;c_ ] ¥

DlmnMAqumoNs o ;sunuummosmomsm&maomm 2

" MECIIANICS OFSOLIDS-H CEAN, ;wmw.nmmamamso 1

‘ADVANCED ENGINVEERING SUR CEATIL, wmtwmsmmmu B
o;souosmm) CLR R : .

. MECHANICS

o

5
89

69
2]

7 -

| eems TMNsPORTm 3 o
. CE313 -sou_muwdcs, R 3 : stwm}
CEA12 ADVANCED RLUY szowms e 1 oo
‘BH-316 PROFESSIONAUETHICS: .. . .. PAXISTAN STUDIES. N G 3. EXNP
1ONSAU, Paoummanqsrnmz' O 261 monucnoummwn.»mwcmnugzumcnmﬁ, .2, EXMP_.

CEAIL | ADVANCED cmm I ) L mommmmum;un) i . v BXMp
CcE M srkummmnvsmt - ENGINEERING MECHANICS. . . ey P
SPRING2Z  © * gmonucnosmcomummocmmma ‘ ; %
_ - ceans S SORCED CONCRETEDESIGN .. VL ENGINEERING MATERIALS 2 ) bow
- . CE-311L GEOTEGMCALAND FDUNDAﬂOt{ INGENE UL § i ’ h r = BASICELEC"RD M'ECDIFNICAI mau‘EEnela‘w) = - BEXMP
CEI DISASTER MANAGEMENT _ _ * “ g y n»\sxca.ﬁmomecmmmacn-mmo 2 EXMP
CE-32} Gsottumlmmurumomouawmmmo ._ : ENGDS DRAWING FORC wn.a:o mems 2
CEABL mauwmmo-m.\mcmmemnqu - ”n@m"c AL M .. y 'mmm
CE3D) }uclmnymtmcsuq;gmma CONCRE!'ﬁTECClumeLOGY(uB) . _|>
CULCERIs | lmumrcmamm : : - EXMP
BI1-326 TECHNICAL REPORT \smuﬁ&mssmmonsuus 10 : _ S
) . oras o236 | T : By ) . Endof‘l’nuu:npt

lssuln Amhority

“Controller of Examinations

- page-lofi

PHASE-H, HAYATABAD PESHAWAR, KHYBER PAKHTUNKHIWA, PAKISTAH l o - i &
A - - . th
S a o : L
Student Name & Muhammad Riaz . Deprec/Prog. Bachelor of Scicace in Civil Engincering Regjstration No : 091-20-11 076 8 -
Father Name + Taslim Khan,/' P Specialization + NXXX / Batch No : 1,\'11-10-1019 R’ =
CNIC/ Passport # ¢ 2110!-]462934-5\ Prog Commenced : Fall -2020 - Mode of Study : Regular.
Date of Birth : 03 Scpu:mbcr. 991 Prog, Completed : Spring 2023 v Campus’ an Campus




REGISTERED NO. Rl ,iF
“GAZETTE -~
KBYEER P A&E.'U.T UBTBHVVA : : ~

" Published by Authority
]PESHAWAR, FRIDAY, 15TH MAY, 2020. .

GOVERNILIENT OF KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA !
. PUBLIC HEALTH ENGG: DEPARTMENT

NOTIFICATION
Dated: 3157 July, 2013.

N0.SO( E)PHE/l 9/2009 n pursuance of the prowsmns conbamed 1n sub rule(2)

~of rule 3 of the North-West Fs ontier Provmce Civil Servants (Appointment, Promotion

direct that in the Public Health Engineering Department’s (Recruitment and
' |Appointrnent) Rites, 2010, the following further amendments, shall be made, namely:

i
AMENDMENTS :

In the Appendix,-

i

iy Against serial No.3,.in. co!umn No.5, for the existing entry, the followmg shaill
be substututed nameiy

. "By promotlon, on the basis of senuorlty -cum-fitness, from amongst the -

B Assistant Engineers, Assistant Design Engineers and Sub Divisional Officers,
who posses Degree in B.E/B.Sc Engtneering (Civil)  from- a recogmzed
University with five years service as 5uch and have passed the Departmentat
Professnonal Exammatlon

.> ._7 ) Agamst serial No.4, in column N5, for the exnstmg entrtes the'
follciving shall be subsututed nameiy;

“(a) five per cent, by promotion, on the basis of seniority-cum-
fitness, from amongst the direct graduate Sub Engineers, who
. possess Degree in B.E/B.Sc Engineering (Civil) from a recognized
University with five years service as such;

=, ‘ five per cent, by promotion, on the basis of seniority-cum-

fitness, from amongst the in “service graduate Sub Engineers, who
_possess Degree in B.E/B.Sc Engineering (Civil), from @ recognlzed
University with five years service as such:

. anaen

land Transfer) Rules, 1989, the Government of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa is pieased to \ :

S_E CamScanm




b

KHYBER PAKHTUNKWHA GOVT: GAZETTE, EXTRAORDINARY, 1578 MAY, 2020 -~ / Z -
() three per cént, by promotion, on the basis of seniority-cum- ‘
fithess, from amongst Sub Enginéers, who possess Degree in’

B.Tech Hons. (Civil), from a recognized University with five years
service as such? ‘ ‘ '

(d) twenty per cent, by promotion, on the basis of seniority-cum-
fitness, from amongst the Sub Engineers, who possess Diploma in
Civil / Electrical / Mechanical Technology with ten years service as
such and have passed the Departmental Examination; and

i

(e) sixty-sefven per cent by initial recruitment”.

SECRETARY :
PHE DEPARTMENT

Printed and publishod by the Manager,
Staty, PAg, Doptit, Khyhor Pakhitunkhwa, Pashawar.




GOVERNMENT OF KHYBER FPAKHTUNKHWA " /) 2
PUBLIC HEALTH ENGG: DEPARTMENT S

1~
g

f‘ ' Dated Peshawar, the _3_1_‘/ 01 /2022 e
1 | — (3 -
BN NOTIFICATION |

No.SO(Estt)/PHED/1-3/2020-21; In pursuance of the provisions contained in
sub-rule (2) of rule 3 of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Civil Servants (Appolntment, Promation and

Transfer) Rules, 1989, the Public Health Engineering Department, In consultation with the
Establishment Department and Finance Department, hereby directs that in this Department’s
Notification No.SO(Estt)/PHED/1-9/2010, dated 06-03-2010, the following Further amendments
shall be made, namely:

AMENDMENTS

SR In the APPENDIX:- ‘

(1) Under the heading “Engineering Cadre™ .

B () agalnst Serlal No.03, in Colum No.02, for the existing entry, the following shall
S be supfstituted, namely: i

“Ekécutive Engineer/Design Engineer/Deputy Director (Technical)/Deputy
Director (L‘abs/ Projects) (BPS-18)
1

()  after Serial No.03, the following new entries shall be Inserted In the respective
Columns, namely: :

3-A | Technical Officer/Deputy "By promotion, on the basis of senlority-cum-
Director (M&E) (BPS-18) fitness from amongst the holders of the posts of

. Asslstant Enginecrs/Assistant Design Engineers/
' Sub Divisional Oficers/Assistant Director (Tech)/
Assistant  Technical ' Officer/Assistant  Director
(M&E)/Assistant Dircetor (Lisbs)/Assistant Director
(Projects), who possessés Degree of B8.Tech
(Hons) or Diploma of Asscciate Englneering from
a recognized University/ Board with five years' | i
service as such.” ‘

: k - i ‘Note: For the purpose. of promotion, joint
by 1 .| senlority of B.Tech (Hons) & Diploma holders shalt
: . | be reckoned from the date of promotion to

8PS-17, '

in clause (), for the words "Five percent”, the words "Two percent” shall
be substituted;

. A) againﬁfserial No.04, in column No.05, 'l
In clause (b), for the words “Five percent”, the words “Three percent”
: |

(
—@®)
s shall be substituted; ,
!

a)
(©) "I clause (c), for the words "Three percent”, the words “Eight percent’ 4
‘ shall be substituted; and Lo ,

(dy  after clause (c), as so amended, the following Note shali be| nserted;
namely: '

“Note:for the purpose of promotion, the senlorlty of B.Tech (Hons)
! Degree holders shall be reckoned from the date of appointment or
; I acquiring the Degree, whichever [s later; and

b : (2) Under the heading “Water Quality (WQ) Laboratory's Technica! Staff":

()  agalnst Serial No.26, In.column No.05, for the existing entry, the following shall
be substituted, namely: "

“By promotion, on the basls of senlority-cum-fitness, from émon st the hold :
| of the nost of Research Officer (Water Quality) with five years ser%ice as such?":s

CS CamScapnn -




!
u

(if)

against Serial No.28, In column No.05,
be substitutec}, nz_:mely:

for the existing entry, the following shall

Ny

(a) Twenw'-'ﬁve percent by promotion, on th
from amongst the holders of the

post of Laboratory Assistant who

e basis of seniorlty-cum-fitness, |-

possess at least second class B.Sc Degree in Mlcroiii\?l%gy :c'; Chemistry
from a recognized University, with 5-years service as sucn; a

(b) Seventy-five percent by initlal recruitment.

(i) after Serial No.28, the following new entries shall be inserted, in the respective
Columns, namely;

(a) Twenty-five  percent by

“28-A | Laboratory At least Second 18 to 30
Assistant Oivision Secondary | years promotion, on the basis of
(BPS-08) School Certificats or its seniority-cum-fitness,  from

equlvalent qualification
1| form a recognized
Board with two years
Diploma In Laboratory
Techniclan from a

. recognized Medical

o Faculty.

(b)

amongst the holders of the
post of Laboratory Technician
with 5-years service as such. _

Seventy-five percent by Initial
recruitment; and

(iv)

)
!
1
!
!
i
|

10)
11)

(Estt)/PHED/1-9/2020-21;
|

Against Serial No.’ig, in Column No.05, for the existing entry, the following shall
be substituted namely: . ,

(a8) Fifty percent by promotion, on the basis of senlority-cum-fitness, from
amengst the holders of the post of Laboratory Attendant who possess at
least Second Division Secondary School Certificate or its equivalent
qualification from a recognized Board and two years Diploma in |

Laboratory Technician from a recognized Medical Faculty, with 5-years
service as such; and - ’

(b) _Fifty percent by Inital recruitment.

SECRETARY TO
, GOVT: OF KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA
PUBLIC HEALTH ENGG: DEPARTMENT

N |
Dated Peshawar, the 31/ 0% /2022

Copy forwarded to the:-

All Administrative Secretaries to Govt, of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa.
Secretary to Governor Khyber Pakhtunkhwa.

Principal Secretary to Chief Mintster Khyber Pakhtunkhwa.
Accountant General Khyber Pakhtunkhwa,

Chief Engineer (North/South/East/Center PHE Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Peshawar,
Registrar Peshawar High Court / Service Tribunal Peshawar, /

All Superintending Engineers PHE / XENs PHE Department Kh
Manager Government Stationary & Printing Department,

PS to Chief Secretary Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Province.

PS to Secretary PHE Department Khyber Pakhtunkhwa, Peshawar
Office Order File.

yber Pakhtunkhwa. |
. : {




e ,: K »
i .
.'3 . /
IS HH/
K -5 L
B )
11
l[t !;i):':* A
N ‘I’;Z“ OFFICE or rm. cmu' uscmr LR (qoum)
X1 e PURL G DIE TRLYDE ¥ N
{ / ) m':n_mnt meumm I’.mnsl_cmhnlmll.am.umw
S ) t .
Al y Ne 14 1 E~9 PHE,
\ .. 6‘ /% /y”"— Dated i'.Q’ShKIWM, 111¢£’|m017.'

In terms of tevised leave rules, 1981, u\lnctlun-'lo the grant of 710.days extnd

otdinary leave for slwdy. 10 respest of bir. a2 Ahmad, Sub Engineer (ni‘silz) atrached wilie

: 9mc° of. ﬁ“@ﬁ\le Enginter PIE Division Kark, bt hercby granted - with effect from
| 25.09.2017::: za;go.zmo‘ Wit p;fL | . {

Chief Bngineer (South) '
Copy furuud:dlothc R

- AR Supenm:ndlng Enginees PIR Cucta hohal for information,
- 2. Uxceutive Engineer PHE Division Karnk with teference Gy his letier Ro.3-41-2 .
dated 23.11.2017 for information.
3. Dinrict Accounts Officer Kanik,

N 4. Officlad concemed,
b ,
B
j . ¢ o [
CHiel Engincer (Shuth)
. /__,.., '

e

s e R AT T

| o @ CamSc |




<

Better Copy Annexure “H” - Page No / &

OFFICE OF THE CHIEF ENGINEER (SOUTH)

- PUBLICHEALTH ENGINEER DEPARTMENT KHYBER PAKH TUNKH WA

PESHAWAR

No 19/E-9/PHE '
Dated Peshawal the 13/ 12/2017

OFFICE ORDER"'

In terms of revised leave rule, 1981 sanction to the grant of
730 days extra ordinary leave for study, in respect of Mr. Ljaz Ahmad
' Sub Engineer (Bll 12) attached to the office of Executive PHE
Division Karak, is hereby granted with effect from 125/09/2017 to
14/09/2019 without pay. | - |

[\, ]

Chief Engineer (South)

~ Copy forwarded to:-
1, Super 1ntend1ng Engineer PHE Circle Kohat for information _

2, Executive Engineer PHE Division Karak with 1efel ence to his letter
- | No 3-4/E-2 dated 23/11/2017 for mformatlon

- 3. District Accounts Ofﬁcel Karak
4, Official concerned

, N
Chief Engineer (South)




OFI‘ICF OF THE CHIEF ENGINEELR SQUiI M)

PUBLICHEALUTH ENGG: DEPTT: IIYBER PAKHTUNKHWA, PESHAWAR
wmuuummmmmmm@mmmmmmmwwm

No._05/ F-£ _IPHE,

Dated Peshawar, t’nr;,ZLO/ 07 12019

To,
: The Sceretary to Govt of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa,
Pubiic Heaith Engg: Dcpnrlmcnt
Pyshawar,
Subject: APPLICATION FOR EXTRA ORl)INARY LEAVE FOR FURTHER
EDUCATION.

It is submilted that onc Mr. Tjaz Ahmad was appointed as Sub Engincer on
09.03.2017. The official applied for two-years study leave vide Exceutive Engincer PHE
Division Karak No.3-4/E-2 dated 23.11.2017. There was no lcave available on his credit

due to less length of ?crwcc, the official wos granlcd two-ycars cxtra ordinary leave for

submitted an ':pphcunon vide Superintending Engincer PHE Clrclc Kohat No.03/SE/PHE/3

doted 16.09.2019 (copy attached), requesting therein for 365-duys sludy fcave w.e.f.
25.09.2019 for purposc of study.

ft Is ﬁ*rthcr to mention here that sanction of study leave is in purview of
Finance Department. Therefore, it is requested that necessary ex-post sunction for study
leave of two years w.e.f 25.09.2017 to 24.09.2019 already granted ‘vide this office order
No 19/'E-9IPI-113 dated 13.12.2017 (copy enclosed), s well a5 now npplled for 365-days
w.c.f 25.09.2019 may kindly be arranged from Finance’ Departmein (o regularize his extra
ordinary leave alrcady availed as well as for 365-days applicd now so that the ofﬁcnl may

continue his study for acquiring htghcr quahﬁcanon please. .

. DAJ/As above : ‘ Chief BHg (Soutl&-

ébpy forwarded to the Superintending Eng'mccr PHE C rcle Kohat, with
reference to above for information.
: o

id

th—Chicf S gy cr(Souq')_

study without pay as per leave rules Para-9 (copy attached). Now again the official has -




OFFICE OF THE, SUPERINTENDING EN(:INDER
PUBLIC HEALTHE ENGINEERING CIRCLL KOHAT

SE/PHE/ S - Dated Kohat & /09 /2019 / :}...

The Chief Engineer {South)
; public Healih Engg: Depit:
o Khyber Pakhtunkhwa
Peshawar,

(:v
4

subject:- APPLICATION FOR EXTRA ORDINARY LEAVE FOR FURTHER EDUCATION.

DR
<

leave cpphcchon of Mr ljoz Ahmed Sub Engmeer PHE Sub Division

T/Nasrati along with leave Proforma received from EXECUth Engineer PHE Division

V,{.L\\ Karak vide No. 26/E-2 dated 12/09/2019 is sent herewith for further process under
[ ' rJ‘H ~
C ihe rules please.

- l\

DA/AS above

. ' . SUPERINTENDING ENGINEER—
' Public Health imeering Circle
S Kohat

H

~ -Copy to the Executive Engineer PHE Division Kordk‘—{br information w/r 1o

. " J
7
. : L ,
A’W o . SUPENNTENDING ENGINEER
/ ' _ Public Health Engineéering Circle
S - Kohat. .
“ B gh |

- -

¢ ° - ‘- 0. 4

4o o CRTIAT
j

* ol
- ’ .d R - R R R '
fppbeepiun Yt wi¥ dur e daed IR / ;
. ; .

S¢ j:"‘




10, e Susrtendig € - O/ S.E PHE Circie Rolat
. e Superintending Engineer, o
Public Heaith Engg: Circle Dai.,'iF:O_;B,Q.L DAted L&sLIL T
Kohct ‘ - CaseNo ,S!Z//éz 5
subject:- WXTRA ORD!:».’ARY LEAVE FOR

)

FFICE OF THE E ENGIN 5
No _ﬁ_fé__/E%’?/ Dated PHE Karak the/ Z/09/2019

'FURTHER EDUCATION -

, Mr llcz Ahmad Sub Engineer of PHE Sub Division T/Ncsrch
have been cpply/submmed Extra’ Ordinary Leave for Further Education under ‘
IHe service rules 1981 with respect grant of 365- days for pefformance of
"education” with effect from 25/09/2019 to
information on_,d further process under {he rufes please.

DA/As above

020 are sent herewaih for ‘

PHE DIVISION KARAK

|
Nl

.
. L.y T R ) 7 et
Appdwaiva forn fur oAb <er Tenwe ket A0 U
. ..
A .




T -APPUCATION I‘OR LIAVE (94

i

{

|

1[ o ! ' NOTEN: 1~cm l o 9 must be. filled in by '\!1 apphcums {b.m 12 nppltcs only in the &
: Gnvcrmnent Servanis, of BPS-\G and above.

{

n

l

Lo N.i “c ol ,xpplu“mt /Vl/}—.; -_JJ% A"/M'lml"/ 9&!—&&1«3‘1%
'Lz...vc T‘.ules upphdabiu 5;@«41/2“&; .y fg/

.. Pest held. . /JAE,/QZ?LG"’L

4‘" ' D\.p-n\nu i, or olﬁcn. XE/\/ ///Z‘&,HH /’{f"?ﬁ .é

5. P’\;,(ﬁts 70. :
HRA 1526 ) ep mz ﬁm a8 9‘?‘,40(/

b TEREUETIOE g 155, -

"oy other ccmpcnsmuw allowance dluwn m the plc.scnl post,

TN

A ,,Ih{ o . .\‘) N.\lun.nn lcsWt applicitdar. (9?6/44’-5”1(1 ZW”“’ -

v i (bJ Per iod oflt.nvc in davy, = 365 d o
" ©Bae o[commcnccmwl @{g& cTZAaaU 3!.5—4‘ 930/}‘%‘95"'?3&9
8 . I’amtul'\l RulLlRuh.a undu whuch lcuvc 5 ndm\smb\c ' ’
] 9. . (un D. l.. of n.Lum fmm tas h..w;.. &l,/?/}a/?
. L (b) 'N'\uucoi i(.a"(. . ‘ . .;' : '
. n . . . . .‘ . N ': . PRI
' ‘..,\,): S Pc._ucd of\cn\lgr.\'-:\ny.r..”,,
avy S R . . .o S,
P . .. . R R
*‘-5_:" . Dute o o e A Wf('(
A '.,‘ N ' : ' . V
1:.";\-'!_., R L W e e SaooL [,mmuc ofapphc'mt.
.‘:'-_,‘;-,17',{)( _ 10. Rimarl\' m.on*\menrl'mon of l\ct.omxu\’m ) qfitcc R a
¢ AU U Certifisg \ that [aa\'c '\pphed {ocls adm\ssxb\. Ando: JRMe_ __Lfﬁz_____,,
k.o - nECEsANTY condllicn- are Lu\i‘mv.n R R
g N (il Dinels Diie- L& Bixwly
: Date W:cm.({ A wJ C'B7‘ l L\«—(_ b’ﬁ'vcrﬁiE(‘l““f‘_—-——-
v : L‘_mw’ 5 o ks 1.&_& x Creat -\éﬁfmzndlim‘
i - /\Gh‘fu-
b w.pfﬂ Augﬂg-fluwrw 'Q""‘GU‘LQ n'“d'wjd o YR B
4 ' V.Laﬂ.u_zcs uu&u LL(\[TI-Q': ‘ gzm%f!u.
H Dalg . .--——-—"_’ .
o uuﬁ ’NJL L9) ?7 _~ 0
L‘ . . Det‘mm.non J—
‘t | .43 . Ovders’ 0(' lhc. sunrf\onmg authority ¢ cc\*bfy;m, thm o uu. L\P“X"?,!‘"lf"gn I:fb)‘ -
: l . : ‘\ppht"\m 15, hl\cly o the same post cariving Ve Lomacnwow befng CTETE LT
:,= 'j»._.'.t.\o“'“ “
R Dage o o "'--:.'_"-' "-""" -t siiﬁ‘j:":\ yo F",:%,T.:y .:-'-'——
P SO R —
B ’ v . . < .:
‘.i'. . ' ¢ B ’ . . v o« ! ! ' N l '
. ls'\mllcuiunll‘:\u|\ fur Wit der leuve e TR ‘ ' :'|'- .l . ’ i
/
/

§§_ CamsS¢




- To,

The Chief Engineer (South),
public Health Engineering Department,
Khyber Pakhtunkhwa, Peshawar.

Through. Pt'u;_ter Channel,

APPLICATION FOR LEAVE EXTENSION WITHOUT PAY FOR

! ...20,_

\

i

!
(|
1

Subject:-
URTHER EDUCATIOE - s
' R/Sir,

It is respectfully. submitted that I am going. to perform further
study in five to six semester in Civil Englneering field due to which I'neeq

leave of 365-days under leave rules 1981.

mentioned period w.e.f 25,09.2019, please.

g

It is hereby reguested to grant me leave for the above

Yours sincerely
Ll

(1jaz\Ahnjad
Sub Engineer
'PHED Karak




The Chicf Engincer South,
Public Health Engineering Department
Peshaw:ar.

'I’hrough Proper Chxmnel

. Sir, W

the expiry of the said leave, {he undersigned requested foro

! e,

"""'”""‘\—\ complete (he remaining portion of his studies.

handied rightly and the same request was forw

submission to {he Finance Department for granting stu

jetter of Chicf Engineer NO. 05/E-b/PHE dated 20-08-2019 (F/B). However, the fact is that the

application has never requested for the study leave. Morcover, §

jcave by the department is not covered under FR-87(a) (F/C). As per the Iaw in VAEUE, leave may

be reduced or regretted but the nature of leave cannot be modificd.

Kuiping in view the above, the request of the department for study leave in favour

of the applicant was regretted by the Administrative  de

Y‘ SO(Esll)/PHEDI" -90/2018-19 dated 01-10-2019 (E/D). Therefore, the awaited applicant was not
st for the ONE YEAR E EOL. Resultantly , 8

informed well in time about the outcome of his reque

major portion of time of the petmoner was lost.

Thercforc, iti

from 24-09-2019 (e-e<f 24-09-2019 till dated ont retrospective basis) and onward up o 23-09-
ided under Sub-rule (1) of Rule-12 rend

khwa Revised Leave Rules 1981(F/E)

2021 as fresh grant, strictly under the provision as prov
with Sub-rule 3) of lhe Ruie ibid of the Khyber Pakhtun

enabling the npphcant to complete hi
regularization of the ﬂwanmg period of service plense.

Dlary Na. Q:—Tﬁ

(W A

Date; 24 9] %0 2o
Caseho. £~ 4 WT ﬂ‘
CERHE.(3) &

B éﬁ;.

Subject: . EXTRA ORDINARY LEAVE WITH QUT PAY

With due respect, it is slated extra ordinary leave for two yeuts Was granted to the
applicant with cﬂ'ect from 25-09-2017, which whuld to be expired on 24-09

purpose of higher study/Education vide office order No. 19/E-9/PHE date
ne year extra EOL, cnnblmg him 10.

Hosever, this request for onc year EOL was not
arded to the administrative department for onward
dy Leave in favour of the applicant vide

s now, requested for the grant of Twe VEARS EOL with cffect

s remaining portion of studies and to enable to make

ME.EPH.E Uoptt: | ﬂfoﬂ
| (qouth) v "L‘[ 7" / S You(s 'imthl‘ully.

Eng\ljrz Ahthad

Y2 )
/ Sub l:ngme'.r Dlstnct KaruL

.2019, for the
d 13- 12-20!7 (F/A). At

such conversion of the nature of

pariment vide. letter NO

i ]
oo

pgre

ﬁ”“”w"’”




GOVERNMENT OF KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA
" PUBLIC HEALTH ENGG: DEPARTMENT.

No.SO(Estt)/PHED/1~ 43/2.019 -20

Dated Peshawar, the November 05, 2020

" The Chief Engineer (South), .
. Public Health Engg: Department Peshawar '

Subject:  APPLICATION FOR EXTRAORDINARY LEAVE WITHOUT li Y FO
: FURTHER EDUCATION.

. I am directed to refer to your letter No.01/E-6/PHE ~ dated
26-10-2020 on the subject noted above and to return herewith the subject case

in original with the remarks that the official concerned is required to get study

leave for the purpose of further education. Furthermore, you are.also required to
give brief service history of the official concerned as the length of service is
mandatory for the grant of study leave/extraordinary leaveiwithoijt pay.

SECTION oé%&g%
SH 2o

Encls; As above

C.E.2 —-_uc'ﬁ‘ﬂ— fé\o F’Lav'e.ol"/ .
_.,__._3.{}.\% %é »(s t} :
oluw\ 2020
e ‘;;/\/ (Q«/ MW |
‘////ww
e Ll Crip J/ | Aﬂ/
. oA ? / |
| )J"l ]
o

22




-3~

lil. ' - . Ne.__of ! ﬁ’é . /PHE,

Dated Peshawar, the26/70 12020,
To, 4

The Secretary to Govt'; of Khyber Pakhtunkhsa,
Public Health Engg: Departiment,

Peshawar .
/

APPLICATION FOR EXTRA ORDINARY LEAVE WITHOU'F
PAY FOR FURTHER EDUCATION.

Subject:

Enclosed please find herewith n copy of letter No.0I/SE/PHE/3
dated 24.09.2020, received from Superintending Engincer PHE ,C':ircle~ Kahat
alongwith Leave Proforma in respect of Mr. ljnz Ahmad Sub Engineer, request
therein for grant of leave extension 365-days wilhout pay for enhancement of

qualificationitwith effect from 25-09-2020 to 25.09.2021 for further necessary
action as per Govl. Rules and golicy.

7~
D.A/As above. ChieTingineer (South)
} Per /17 |

Copy forwarded for information to the Superintending Engincer

P'HE Circle Kohat for information wir to the above.

Chicf Eagincer (South)

4




1

if
fTt

‘o

" ZNY OFFICE OF THE SUPERINTENDING ENGINEER

1

. ‘g.tffs\fn_
- (fr

" Phone: 09229260332 Email: Ehodcircleﬁ@gmml com

No._@L_ /SL‘.IPHE! 3 Dated Fohat Eyq 12020

\

To. ‘ ' .
The Chief Engineer {Soulh),

|
|
|
| - Pyplic Health Engg: Department,
: E Peshcwcr

i

|

Subject:- APPLICATO OR_LEAVE EXTENS _WITHOUT, P ‘Y FOR_FURT
EDUCATION,

’J Reference:- Execulive Engineer. PHE DMsuon Kcrok !eﬂer No. 05/E-2 daled
' . 24/09/2020

L
o ' 1 |

.bpplied/subr'r"lined extension Leave for further education'under the.service rules

1981 for grant of 385-days without pay for entiancement of gualification wilh

el

effect from 25/09/2020 to 25/09/2021 which is sent herewith for further process

under the rules please.

i ' ' .

DA/As above
SUPERINTENDING ENGINEER

Public Health Engineering Circle

Kohgke—"""

FIAD
H

Copy for information: is forworded to Executiver Engineer Public

. Health Engineering Division Karak with reference to above. :

CELEDmt]
: h-o
B Lf Si ‘ - SUPERINTENDING ENGINEER
(WA N ' Publi¢ Health Engineering Circle
7_,5] Al 2% (\/ | ih Ene e

ST o
GLo :

——

AHL. 6‘%

Mr. ljoz Ahmad Sub Engineer of PHE Sub, Division T/Nosrati has
T .

.-‘ PUBLIC HEALTH ‘ENGINEERING CIRCLTJ i{OIIAT ’ 2(1 -




e 3 e T, S T TR S T )

TLETRTTET

EE T

O

i,
.2.‘"
3.
4?
5.
Q~
o
l,i. -
Y
- :
L ]
=
10.
I
12
13

Date

NOTﬁSa

(b) I’-mod ofluwc iia day . o
. . v P a4 ?:
I @Bmc of cm'mnf'hccun,nt -%ﬁﬂlﬁ/ W“ &-j “0 ? -25&7&3-5- e

. Par tu.u.a: Ruhe/m\lc:. undu whzch 1cavc 1s adnussnb\e

1 " vt ' "‘

item l to 9 mu.,l be. filléd in by '\ll apphcuntk [an'l 12 npphes only m {
"‘mvern.menl Suv-nsts of BPS-1G, aid abov&.

Nanc uf .Lpglrcum Jag M\/v&%a’(

Lc..vc P.ules uuphcabh. W"ﬁ /Zut, /gg/ . -
.SNJbthﬁh¢a%> f::' ' R

xwu4, el

“Post hc .

Dcmrnm.nl or oﬂ'c:. )(E/,/ ///f‘-/,}@otd /% /'g :
/Ekm ﬁ

ué'g?ﬂ allowa%ou%;lancnw ;ygwuhw« . 9_76 /05/ 21_5/7 !

“or othel compcnsmow allowanee dmwn m the p\t.sent poat

(.x) N.\luu.. ou lcaw dm.!u d (v QWI%_‘) fLa-MvU'p
CZéu>—"3 ’ ]

(.u Dri" c-l':-.lm n ﬂom l..N !uaw 02 > 7—0? 029

'(b) N'muc-o! 1ca"c -

j@:!’c,\‘lcc\ q("‘\gavg n d‘n'y.,; K _:.; .
L :S'lbgm_\mr '.:_.
Ramaiks u.wmn\endauon of thc wutxoﬁu a ofﬁcc I

- Cenified thal fesve -\ppm.dfdr is ndm\ss:}ah E.I.l.'lfict Rl\lb '-_
ru.ceasurv conditions -\reiulm\ad R TR

dut/%bl Ny 24 j&9ﬂ5533?.

oLt of f1s %@MJ‘

; 15 NG . Zan,ég P | &Zéﬁ{ gﬁ
R -ﬁ%zﬁﬁldtt‘b &4 - /U’/i&

L .42/&4" ZL////Z,CC{/
Cene’ [ 987

. Ordcrs of lh(. snn. ijég quthortty cca n ymg tlmt on lhe c.\pz y ofH Iz,rwc n JL-. .
' apphcwnh:ﬂdwly hesame poslca.nymgtbe compcn:\mly bcm;, dfﬂ“‘ -

+ . “ . -
. - -

A Slgn.\gmc____-__-_____,_,

Sct




V-

The chief 'LEngineer {South)

PHED Peshawar .

THROGH PROPERCHANNEL o
: ,:x-,ffq ofclth

3

- =

Subject: APPLICATION FOR *

FURTHER EDUCAT!ON

e et ——

It.is respectfully submltted that 1 am’
‘further study in seven to eight semesterin. cwﬂ

peshawer due to which | need leave of 365 days under jeave rules

1981.

- |
s hereby requested to grant me leave for the abové
s mentioned period w.e. £25.9. 2020 to 25. 92021 ,pleaae 8

ot ﬂe.oJV&“ :
it «"WITHOUT pAY FOR

b -

going to perform
engmeermg field in UET

" Your sincerely

PHED karak




I‘UBLIC ITEALTYI ‘[‘NGG DI‘PT‘T‘ ICHVBER PAICH I’!’UNKF]'WA Pl'.'.Sl-I.AWAR

.

226 B mmmmammmmmhmx {Nawnb)

.  No_O02| Eto /PHE,

p

Rty oo

-
PR ¥y

R R A s e

.
L T

EA A TR =

ok
. 4 - 4
. .. “"Dated Peshawar, the 20/ I 12020, gﬁ:
TO, i . ’ : _; 3
The. Secretary to Govt. of Klyber Pakhtunkhwa, i ;'E:
Public Healtli Enginecring Depariment, : vk
Peshawar. § Ty
Subject:  EXTRA oRmNAtiv.' LEAVE WITHOUT PAY. S ,,% s
: i 311
E' ivlosed please i'md herewith a-copy of. leucr No. 03/SB/PHE/03 dated - : F’
'18 11 ')020 alongwith its enclosures received froi’ Supermtendmg Engmcer PHE Circle - i : %
‘Koha, whnch is selfoexplanalory for information and further necessary action. - -
|
- DA/As above ~ Co e - &hlef "\c r(South) ‘ 5 .
. C0py to lhe Supem\tendmﬂ Engmeer PHB Cnrcle Kohat for mformatlon wir N 8
to the above. , N
P ' '_'-
. Chi ; gk
at R o
4 X . i R 2 0%5
.t . | ' HER I ¥ o
: | B %:«;
'«‘.1.\ E B {:. ‘
/
i
!
X B3
' i
e n At e . i i
A Z
'
i




- $43Y OFFICE OF THE SUPERINTENDING ENGINEER *

- 2p-

- &2 PUBLIC HEALTH-ENGINEERING CIRCLE KOHAT.

w ' . ' " " - .
Y- To. o3 JSEPHE! 3 Dated 38 7 1 /2020,
.TO, [ -
The Chief Engineer (South), ' .
Public Health Engg:. Department,
Peshawar,
. T .
N Subject- ~ EXTRA ORDINARY LEAVE WITHOUT PAY. g
Reference:- Executive Engineer PHE Division Karak office leller No. 02/E-2, dated _
17/11/2020. : X
i; . . . -
@ Mr. ljaz Ahmad Sub Engineer of PHE Sub Divislon T/Nasrali has
. : ! P
submitted application for grant of extra ordinary leave without pay under service rules
UEmEmliili1981 with effect from 24/09/2019 to 23/09/2021 is sent herewith for fufther process.
M ‘E.::
. SUPERINTENDING ENGINEER
. Public Health Engineering Circle
P -
1. Copy for information is forwarded to the:- N ‘ TS
e ~., 1. Executive Engineer PHE Division Karak.
an .~._‘_,:‘:b-» AN . . [
r : . .
* t B ot || "’f
sl ' | /
C.E.P.I.E Deptt: - SUPERINTENDING ENGINEER
| T / o Public Healh Engineering Circle
; Ciey Ny 3 g r;?_& - ‘ ‘ rlfohlal ] |
1519 J11) 2 2, 1 vy
Ceue ) / . c
: Cli. il (" |
, ’ ArL. e&/ /‘_ -
: .':i
|
B -
j (A camsea
i




-29-

OFFICE OF THE EXECUTIVE ENGINEER PUBLIC HEALTH
ENGINEERING DIVISION KARAK

o No_ O  JEA. Dated ~ PHE Karok the ! 7/11/2020 -

The Superintending Engineer,
Public Health Engg: Clrcle
Kohat

Subject:- EXTRA ORDINARY LEAVE WITHOUT PAY

Kindly refer to cited subject above, Mr. ljoz Ahmaod Sub
Engineer PHE Sub Division Takhti Nasrati have cpp!ied submitted application for
RS gronl of extra ordmcry leave without pay under service rule 1981 wilh effect from
- W’-‘M/OS’/ZOIS’ to 23/09/2021 are senf herewnh for furiher process pleose
DA/As above
o

a
~==———iSXFCIHIVE ENGINEER
| PHEDIVISION'KARAK

§_§ CamScan




To -— 3 o -
The Executive Engineer :

Public Health Engineering Department

District Karak

Through : Proper Channel .

Subject: EXTR{A ORDINARY LEAVE WITHOUT PAY
Sir,

With due respect, It is stated that Extra Ordinary leave for two years was granted to
me with effect from 25-09-2017, which would be expired on 24-09-2019. At the expiry of the
said leave, the undersigned requested for ane year extra EOL} However, this reguest for one year
I was not handled rightly and the same request was forwarded to the admiinistrative department

a;.f'q,' onward subm:sswn for grantmg study Leave in favour of’ undersigned vide Chief Engineer

for the study leave. Mareover, such conversion of the nature of leave by the department is not

covered under FR-87(a){F/C). As per the law in vague, leave may be reduced orregretted but the
nature of leave cannot be modified.

*‘-Kemeg in view the above, the request of department for study leave in
. favour of me was regretted by the Adninistrative Department vide letter No. SO(Estt)/PHEDIZ-
90/2018 19 dated 01 /10/ 2019 (F/D). Therefore, | was not informed. well in.time about the
A' outcome of my request for the ONE YEAR EOL. Resultantly, a major portion of my time was lost

Therefore, it is now, requested for the grant of Two Years EOL with effect
from 24-08- 2019(w ef 24-09-2019 till dated on retrospective: bdsis) and onward up 'to

123/09/2021 as fresh grant, strictly under the provision as provided under 5ub —rules (1) of Rule -

i>17'read with Sub- rule (3) of the Rule ibid of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Revised Leave Rules 1981
(F/E) pleas. ' -

a | g B

' Yours faithfully




5 T e

4
o

2 fnA i

AL R

TSI LY

[Tl d

-

NOTRS <

-‘.aﬁ;
.

o ——

. Pamc.u a RulelRuics undu whtch h:aw:' xs e.dmtssxble

_ .(.n Dnl'- ci'u.lum ﬁom l.N lu.-w\- 2} 4”-0(,02?

hcm 1 0 9 nmm bc ﬁncd 0 by '\ll npphcanl" lh..m 12 apphes only m m
'.m\vcrmm:nl am-vmts of B'PS 16 and ahovc p

Numc r;l'.nprilrc.am % M" ,a( /" - -
Lcr.vc I'L Ix’.b quhcohlg }W/Zuf/,<,/9'£/ . Co ;

5”’& 59&&1 ST

r

Dcp-ulum.nl or ofﬁcc.xgﬁf;/fww [ : /‘. . .. “ ‘

Post hc\d

Pa) 22-520 ”/L(v 3@,, ;\((,_{_,.2(971_,’;9\// 2’2“4_
{%l ;\Howaggg:lg;yanc;.aﬂowanggfa . Q_)é /o)/ : - RO

or olhen ce mpcnsmol y allowarice drnwn in the pl(.scnt post
a) Nul\m. on lc-\w applwri Tov. a.éﬂv/(ﬂf% ((_a,a,u-/’

(b) l"cnod of]uwc i drw Sé) --:" i

CO Dae ofcomuwnccm-,,nt %&:JJ?E‘M rl) —-o ?

.v(b) N'mnc. o, 1ca"c. e

@ Pcrlcd af” lcnvc . :lny\.
e,
"’“T" |
¢ I s « .

Remark.. re.ngmn‘mndat\un of the,x. "u
- Centificd that Teave uipplied faris ad
ncca sary 1 copditions are !u\ﬁl\ed

"al/fm Dﬂ"" /ZL 7::32‘] -

@/M:t/«lﬁ % /7*"’ @Z,(g; J /7/:‘ ; .S\gt’x‘ntuu___.___i__;
ta

Dcmgnul,mn

[6 '7@ [ad,a,ﬁ PRI 6’2.@’.2\5‘/'- Z

12, R ;Ahdn4>ﬁaaﬁ¢:/ /w&ip
. ‘ N rltLer_/L,L(; ZL&%‘: a‘/
. o, JDI.]ZM {? L‘ 'L(,M,
+ 13 Odets Df d“‘ 5“““' ‘/ﬁ” m\‘hﬂl"tﬁ‘ Ce\\‘l\'YmB thm oh the expi y 6fleave b -_‘..:
, applsmnmglikc\y same post ca.n-ysng llze compcn:\tmy bc.uu, d;a\\ aky i
D;.u:: - ~‘ . R ' S tmsu\c. -“ o
S . A e, !
. PR '
| L
! T S
I s
ik

C»C§




S To

- 'Throug'h Propcr Clmuncl L '." '

g L appellant vxde notlﬁcatlon dated 01/ 12/2022

‘ The Secretary Publlc I-Iealth Engmeermg Department,-
Khyber Paldttunkhwa :Civil: Sec1 etauat Peshawar ER

BPS-17 IN UOTA OF IN SDRVICE GRADUATD 8
Respected Sir
.1) That the appellant was appointed agamst the post of Sub Engmeel BPS 11 no ‘::

BPS-12 on the recommendation of the' Khyber Paldlmrﬂdlwa Pubhc Servrce
Comimission vide order dated 29/1012015. it mO NI 3g

2) That in response the appellant submltted hls arrwal report and s:tarted

perforrnmg his duty qmte efﬁcxently and upto the . entire - satlsfaetton of his
superiors. . B e, g

That durmg service the appellant apphed for Study Leave for perusmg B _e
Civil Engmeermg atIqra Natiofial Umversrty, Peshawar, acco1d1ugly the: Stu ‘y

Leave ‘for. the . pefiod: of two- years was sanctxoned to"—fthe appellant vi e ..
notlﬁcatlon dated 23/12/2020 .

o That whereaﬁer extensxon for furthel ‘one’ ye' Wag also ‘sanctioned . to’!

8) .~'.E'.::"Ihat after suecessful completlon 'of .thefBSc ‘Civil Erigineering B logram, i
appellant was 1ssued the Degree of Baehelor of Sclenee & Bngmeenng by thu x
AR Iqra Nattonal Umversrty i 24/07/2023 : e

l :"-','.That as’ per Rules dated 15105/2020 and subsequent.~ notlﬁcatton d te B
. X 31/01/2022 the: appellant is entitled for promot:on to'the post of AE/SDO Bl"c -
nl S 17 on the ba31s of sernonty cum-ﬁtness and in hght of m-serwce quota S

. That appellant whlle pemsmg hlS case for plomotlon to:the:; post of AE/ 'D' v

. BPS-17, it was-came into the knowledge of appellant through a ‘éliable so I« .-

7 “that the- department considering-the junior colleag‘ues 'of the’ appellant nathe
.7 Mr:Tjaz Ahmad Sub Engmeer for promotton to‘the post of AB/SDO Bl’ -1
e bemg blue eyed to them . TR R .

. 'f That Mr Ijaz Ahmad Sub Engmeer WS appomted as Sub Engmeer BPS 12 v1 -
' lf dated - 09/03/2017: ‘proceeded: ‘on”: TExtra ; Oldmaly Leave Wlthout Pay .-,
-, 23/11/2017 for the’ period of two' yeals requested ‘the department for fuftt

. - extension of hiis EOL foi:the penod of 1 year, s6. excluded the 3-years peripd
- EOL, the appellant total service become 2 years, wluch is less than the peri
o spccnﬁed for promotmn under the 1ules (Dea:th of more than 3 years)




: 9) " .'j'That appellant tlme and agam wsnted the conce. ned quartets for hlS promotto

: _ but of no avatl

e

GROUNDS

TR Vo

A-

'.’. “.t'l LR IR

o That the appellant feelmg aggrleved and hawngl.no;other, .
_ 'Ilnstant department appeal before” yom honor on followmgi‘gtounds mter alm‘-'_:‘ o

That appellant has not been treated by the Departmen .m"accordance

" That accordmg to- Sectmn 9 of the wal st,rvant Act 1973 read w1th Rul > i
- of the appointment, promotion 2 and. transfer Rules and :Notional. proro io -

. "f:, departmental appea,l,.the department coneerne d rnay kmdly be: dn'ecte d:
: - “consider the appellant for ptomotnon to’ the post"" f Assv,tant Engmeen’Si K

o

e

j.‘..~5'1

rnedy ﬁled t

That’ the action and maetton of the depa"tment by not consxdermg
appellant for promation to the post of AL/SDO BPS- 17.is ‘against the law

- facts, norms-of natural justice and materiais on the record hence not tenable B

and liable to be set asnde

law and rules on the subject ioted above and as suclrthe: departrnent violatec
Article 4 and 25 of the Constitution of Islamlc Republlc of I’ak1stan 1973

That the departiment has acted arbitrary and: malaﬁdely by not conmdenm _
the appelldnt for promotion from due date. .. L0075 :

That the treatment meted out to the appellant 'xs clearly based'%:e} '
discrimination and malafide and as such the department vxolated th
principle of hatural justice. : : -

pohcy the appellant is fully entltled for the grant of ante dated promotloril' :

It is: therefore, most humbly prayed that on acceptance:'of the ing nstd £

: ';Pubhc Health: Engmcermg Dmsnon: .
*. ¢ i Northern ] Trlbal Dlstrlct at - '
R 'I’cslnnwar e




ey

H P )

-7

|  VAKALATNAMA
BEFORE THE KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA SERVICE TRIBUY. aL,
EEM
- Afleal No_ /2023
- (APPELLANT)
Mﬂl\ﬁmm RicL . (PLAINTIFF)
- | (PETITIONER)
VERSUS
| 3 | (RESPONDENT)
gim}-'O:ﬁ Jplc ; ___ (DEFENDANT)
I/ IM /? 4L N

D hereby appoint and constitute Noor Mohammad Khattak
Advocate Supreme Court to appear, plead, act, compromise,
withdraw or refer .to arbitration for me/us as my/our
Counsel/Advocate in the above noted matter, without any liability
- for his default and with the authority to engage/appoint any other
Advocate Counsel on my/our -cost. I/we authorize the said
- Advocate to deposit, withdraw and receive on my/our behalf all -
~sums and amounts payable or deposited on my/our account in the
above noted matter.

Dated. [ /202

ACCEPTED

NOOR MOHAMZ?D KHATTAK
ADVOCATE SUPREME COURT

WALEED ADNAN

UMA@/\AROOQ MOHMAND
MUHA;MAD AYUB

: , MAHMOOD JAN
- OFFICE: ADVOCATES
Flat No. (TF) 291-292 3 Floor, -
Deans Trade Centre, Peshawar Cantt.
- (0311-9314232)




