7.

¢ BEFORE THE KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA SERVICE
TRIBUNAL, PESHAWAR

Appeal No. 1002/2024

Muhammad Riaz S/0 Tasleem Khan R/0 Qamar Kheil, Village Baz Ghada, Bara, District
Khyber (Sub Engineer BPS-12) office of the Executive Engineer Public Health Engg:
Division Khyber office situated at Plot No.40, Sector B-1i, Phase V, Hayatabad, Peshawar.

................ . Appellant.
VERSUS

1. Government of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa through Chief Secretary.

2. Public Health Engineering Depart_ment, KPK, through its Secretary. _

3. Chief Engineer (Center), Public Health Engineering Department, Khyber
- Pakhtunkhwa, Peshawar. |

4. Establishment and Administration Department, KPK, Peshawar through its
Secretary. |

5.. Finance Department, KPK, Peshawar through its Secretary

ecrmmneenenens s RESpONdents
INDEX

S.No - Description of Documents Annexure | Page
1 Joint Para wise comments | - 1-4
2. | Authority Letter - 5
3 Affidavit - 6
4 | Order Sheet dated 12.01.2024 A 7-8

- 5 | Copy of amended service rules B 9-10
6 | Seniority list of in-service graduate C 14
7 | Promotion notification of in-service graduate D 12
8 | Notification of actualization | E 13

' - 232 {4+
Dated: Oé/ g C? 2224
eponent

07 23 - 9}110{‘?



7

¥EFORE THE KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA SERVICE TRIBUNAL,

PESHAWAR

Appeal No. 1002/2024

Muhammad Riaz $/0 Tasleem Khan R/0 Qamar Kheil, Village Baz Ghada, Bara, District
Khyber (Sub Engineer BPS-12) office of the Executive Engineer Public Health Engg:
Division Khyber office situated at Plot No.40, Sector B-Il, Phase V, Hayatabad, Peshawar.

................. Appeliant.

Khyor Pakt
VERSUS Scrvio ity rn’?

. &
. Government of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa through Chief Secretary. Py N"'j"'i/
. Public Health Engineering Department, KPK, through its Secretary. ©atca -‘AMH
. Chief Engineer (Center), Public Health Engineering Department, Khyber ’

Pakhtunkhwa, Peshawar.

Establishment and Administration Department, KPK, Peshawar through its
Secretary. '

. Finance Department, KPK, Peshawar through its Secretary

vermnenennennss . RESpONdents

JOINT PARA-WISE COMMENTS ON BEHALF OF RESPONDANTS NO. 1 - 5.

PRELIMINARY OBJECTIONS:

1.
2.
3.

O 00 N O n

That the appellant has no cause of action / locus standi.

That the appellant has not come to this Honorable Tribunal with clean hands.
That the present appeal in hand is not maintainable in its present form and also
in the present circumstances of the issue.

That the present appeal is liable to be dismissed with cost for miss joinder / non
joinder of necessary parties.

That the appellant has filed the instant appeal on malafide motives.

That the instant appeal is against the prevailing laws and rules.

That the appellant is estopped by his own conduct to file the present appeal.
That the present appeal is badly timely barred.

That the present appeal is not maintainable under Section-4 of Service Tribunal

Act 1974 as no departmental appeal has been filed.

RESPECTFULLY SHEWETH,

1.

Correct. It is clarified that offer of appointment was given to the appellant as Sub
Engineer (BPS-11) on 29.10.2015, however, the Provincial Government of Khyber



X =,
! \ ¢’ Pakhtunkhwa upgraded the post of Sub Engineer to BPS-12. After completion of
probation period the appellant was placed in seniority list of diploma holders
(D.A.E).
It is worth to mention here that the present service appeal is not maintainable in
the eyes of law as the appellant concealed material facts from this honorable
Tribunal. The appellant instituted Service Appeal No0.1950/2023 titled
“Muhammad Riaz Vs Secretary PHED & 04 Others” before this honorable
Tribunal seeking promotion to the post of SDO/AE (BPS-17), however, the same
was withdrawn by the appellant on 12.01.2024 (Copy of order sheet dated
12.01.2024 is attached as Annexure-A). the present appeal being devoid of

merit having identical nature of the service appeal withdrawn by the appetlant
on 12.01.2024 may please be dismissed with cost.

2. Incorrect and misconceived, it is clarified that different seniority lists of Sub
Engineers (BPS-12)/(BPS-16) based on qualification in light of existing Service
rules of Public Health Engineering Department framed and amended by Standing
Service Rules Committee (SSRC) comprising of Establishment Department,
Finance Department and Public Health Engineering Department. Seniority list of
Sub Engineers have been maintained by office of the Chief Engineer (Center) PHED
for promotion to the post of SDO/AE (BPS-17) with the following breakup.

Qualifying
S.No | Qualification Quota | Length of
: Service

Diploma of Associate
1. | Engineer(Civil/Electrical/Mechanical froma | 20% 10 years
recognized Technical Board)

2 In-Service Graduate (B.Sc/B.E (Civil)

Engineering From a recognized University) 2% 05 Years
Direct Graduate (B.5c¢/B.E (Civil)
3. Engineering From a recognized University) 3% 05 Years
4. B.Tech Degree 8% 05 Years
: 5. Initial appointment (through KPPSC) 67% -

The quota ibid noted against each discipline will be promoted from their
respective seniority list of Sub Engineers to the post of SDO/AE/ATO (BPS-17) on
seniority-cum-fitness basis.

It is also added that Public Health Engineering Department, in consultation with
the Establishment Department and Finance Department, amended this
Department: Notification No.SO(Estt)/PHED/1-9/2010 dated 06.03.2010. Further
amendments were made in Service Rules of PHE Department vide notification
No.SO(Estt)/PHED/1-9/2020-21 dated 31.01.2022 (Copy of amended service
rules is attached as Annexure-B).




- #' Seniority of in-service graduate Sub-Engineers having B.Sc Civit Engineering
degree/ B.Tech Degree will be reckoned from the date of acquiring degree.

3. Pertains to record. Hence no comment.

4. As discussed in para-2 of the above.

5. Incorrect and misconceived, it is worth to mention here that the present service
appeal is not maintainable in the eyes of law as the appellant concealed material
facts from this honorable Tribunal. The appellant instituted Service Appeal
No0.1950/2023 titled “Muhammad Riaz Vs Secretary PHED & 04 Others” before
this honorabte Tribunal seeking promotion to the post of SDO/AE (BPS-17),

however, the same was withdrawn by the appellant on 12.01.2024.

6. Incorrect and misconceived. Hence denied. .

GROUNDS: -

A. Incorrect and misconceived. It is clarified that the respondent department issued
final seniority list of in-service graduate Sub Engineers, wherein, the appellant is
reflected at serial No.2 (Copy of seniority list is attached as Annexure-C).
Moreover, on 31.05.2024 vide notification No. SO(Estt)/PHED/4-53-B/2024/SDO
Mr.ljaz Ahmad in-service graduate was promoted to the post of Assistant
Engineer/Assistant Design Engineer/Sub Divisional Officer/Assistant Technical
Officer (BPS-17) on regular basis (Copy of Notification is attached as Annexure-D).

Secretary Public Health Engineering department being the competent authority
actualized promotion order of Mr. |jaz Ahmad vide Notification No. SO(Estt)/PHED/4-

53-B/2024/5D0 dated 28.08.2024 (Copy of Notification of actualization is
attached as Annexure-£).

B. Incorrect and misconceived. As discussed in the preceding paras.

C. Incorrect and misconceived. It is also clarified that quota of in-service graduate Sub
Engineer in other departments is not binding on the respondent department and the
appellant has been treated in light of existing service rules of PHE Department
framed by Standing Service Rules Committee (SSRC) being the competent forum
comprising of PHE Department, Finance Department and Es’tablishment Department.

D. Incorrect and misconceived. It is clarified that after amendments in service rules of
PHE Department, existing service rules will be followed in letter in spirit and all the
employees of the respondent department will be treated in light of existing service
rules accordingly.

E. Incorrect and misconceived. As discussed in the preceding paras.

F. Incorrect and misconceived. As discussed in the preceding paras.

G. Incorrect and misconceived. Hence denied.

L= e



" B H. Igtorrect and misconceived. Hence denied.
) l. Incorrect and misconceived. As discussed in the preceding paras.
Incorrect and misconceived. As discussed in para-1 of the above.

Incorrect and misconceived. Hence denied

- X &

The respondent department seeks permission from this honorable Tribunal to raise

additional grounds at the time of arguments, please.

PRAYERS: -
In view of the aforementioned facts, it is, therefore, most humbly prayed
before this honorable Tribunal that the present appeal being vexatious and devoid of

merit may please be dismissed with cost.

L - ' 13
Resp;’néent N¢.3 Respondent No.1&2

Muhammad Yousaf Khayyam Hassan Khan
Chief Engineer(Center) Secretary
Public Health Engineering Public Health Engineering
Department Peshawar Department Peshawar

am

Respondent No.5

" lkram Ullah Khan
ry Secretary
Establishment Department Finance Department




(52

OFFICE OF THE CHIEF ENGINEER (CENTER)

PUBLIC HEALTH ENGG:DEPARTMENT KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA PESHAWAR
Ph: 0919217528 E-mail:centrephed@gmail.com, Plot No. 40, Sector B-Il, Phase-V, Hayatabad, Peshawar

No.(CCh /271 _al rpkE,

Dated Peshawar, The _g é / af‘Z 12024,

AUTHORITY LETTER

It is certified that Mr. Kamran Shahid, Assistant Social Organizer of
Public Health Engineering Division Peshawar is hereby authorized to attend the
Honorable Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Service Tribﬁnal Peshawar in Service Appeal
No.1002/2024 titled “Mubammad Riaz VS Government of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa
through Secretary PHED & (04) Others” on behalf of all the respondents of Public

Health Engineering Department.

D,

Chief Engineer (¢enter)




Y .. -

/ BEFORE THE KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA SERVICE
TRIBUNAL, PESHAWAR

Appeal No. 1002/2024

Muhammad Riaz S/0 Tasleem Khan R/0 Qamar Kheil, Village Baz Ghada, Bara, District
Khyber (Sub Engineer BPS-12) office of the Executive Engineer Public Health Engg:
Division Khyber office situated at Plot No.40, Sector B-I, Phase V, Hayatabad, Peshawar.

................ . Appellant.
VERSUS

1. Government of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa through Chief Secretary.
2. Public Health Engineering Department, KPK, through its Secretary.
3. Chief Engineer (Center), Public Health Engineering Department, Khyber
' Pakhtunkhwa, Peshawar.
4. Establishment and Administration Department, KPK, Peshawar through its
Secretary.
5. Finance Department, KPK, Peshawar through its Secretary

rrsemneene s RESPONdents

AFFIDAVIT

I, Muhammad Yousaf, Chief Engineer {Center) Public Health Engineering
Department Peshawar being official respondent No.3 do hereby solemnly affirm and

declare on oath that the contents of accompanying Joint Para wise comments on behalf

of all the official respondents are true and correct to the best of my knowledge and
belief and nothing has been concealed from this Hon’ble Tribunal. It is further stated on
oath that in this appeal, the answering respondents have neither been placed ex-parte
nor their defense has been struck off.

DEPONENT
CNIC #: 12101-0926179-3




-
e tn m ————_—— — YT [ e e swem R
A irgruiivaransi i R Ay R N e
S an 'y

Rt TR A ke

Ya
» PO

APPEAL NO._ ;f%') D 2023

Mr. Muhammad Riaz, Sub Engineer BPS-12, : .
public Health Engineering Division Northern Tribal District at Peshawar.

........................................... oereess APPELLANT

VERSUS

1. The Secretary Public Health Engineering Department, Khyber
pakhtunkhwa, Civil Secretariat, Peshawar.

2-  The Chief Engineer (South) Public Health engineering
Department Khyber pakhtunkhwa, Peshawar.

3. The Chief Engineer (Centre) F‘ubl'n:1 Health engineering
Department Khyber Paknhtunkhwa, Peshawar. .

4-  The Superintending Engineer PHE Circle Northern Tribal Districts
at Peshawar.

s-  Mr. Ijaz Ahmad, Sub Engineer BPS-12, Public Health Engineering
Department, Khyber Pakhtunkhwa, Pashawar

O POPPPPPR T PEPIY TTTI RESPONDENTS

lllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllllll .

pEAL UNDER _SECTION-4 OF THE KHYBER |

W‘MWM

THE INACTION OF THE RESPONDENTS BY NOT

CONSIDERING THE APPELLANT FOR PROMOTION TO

THE_POST OF ASSISTANT ENGINEER/ SDO ‘BPS-17 IN

QUOTA OF IN-SERVICE GRADUATE AND AGAINST THE

INACTION OF THE APPELLATE AUTHORITY BY NOT

DECIDING THE DEPARTMENTAL APPEAL _OF THE '

APPELLANT WITHIN THE STATUTORY PERIOD OF 90

e . DAYS. . .

PRAYER - '
That on acceptance of the instant service appeal, the
respondents may kindly be directed to consider the
appeliant. for- promotion to the post of Assistant i
Engineer/Sub Divisional Officer ‘BPS-17 with all back !
benefits, Any other remedy which tlhis' august Tribunal '?

| deem fit may also be awarded in favour of the appejlant

gy

R/SHEWETH:
ON FACTS:

Public Heah Engineering Deptt |
Knyber Pakhtunkniva, Peshawar

Ane 7G4,
- _ v A
|
u
!
L\ |
- ‘/’:"”:_ 1
. P
BEFORE THE KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA SERVICE TRIBUNAL,  {* -
_ PESHAWAR b [a %
- 2\

@



present.

i 2. Learned counsel for the appellant requested for
withdrawal of the i_nstant' service ﬁppeal that as per instructions
-of his client .he Eloes':iot want to further press the instant service
;appeal. In this regard his signature has also obtained at the

.margin of ofder-sheet. Consequently the present service appeal

is dismissed as withdrawn. Consign. -

3. Pronounced in open court at Peshawar and given under

ny hand and seal of the Tribunal on this 12" day of January,

¢ - 2024, : .
5 P A by . NN ) (/5

| AN ‘5{ w’ . Y i} |
! Adminic auvc‘(é TICEr 'Membe.r (E)
M 0.0 .2 Chif\fEnginesr (Center)

" A pubiic Healy/Engineering Dopit

Knyber Pathiunkive, Peshawar

e S
BT R -



X3

L@ 72 re« A

&‘L\*ﬁé GOVERNMENT OF KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA

M B PUBLIC HEALTH ENGG: DEPARTMENT
Ve 1/2022
7 et Dated Peshawar, the _31_/01/

NOTIFICATION
No.SO(Estt)/PHED/1-9/2020-21: . In pursuance of the provisions contained in

sub-rule (2) of rule 3 of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Civil Servants (Appointment, Promotion and
Transfer) Rules, 1989, the Public Health Engineering Department, in consultation with the
Establishment Department and Finance Department, hereby directs that in this Department’s
Notification No.SO(Estt)/PHED/1-9/2010, dated 06-03-2010, the following further amendments
shall be made, namely:

. AMENDMENTS
In the APPENDIX:- _ .
(1) Under the heading “Engineering Cadre”:

(i)  against Serial No.03, in Colum No.02, for the existing entry, the following shall
be substituted, namely:

“Executive Engineer/Design Ergineer/Deputy Director (Technical)/Deputy
Director (Labs/Projects) (BPS-18)

(1) after Serial No.03, the following new entries shall be inserted in the respective
Columns, namely:

3-A | Technical Officer/Deputy “By promotion, on the basis of seniority-cum-
Director {M&E) (BP5-18) fitness from amongst the holders of the posts of
Assistant Engineers/Assistant Design Engineers/
Sub Divistonal Officers/Assistant Director (Tech)/
Assistant Technical  Officer/Assistant  Director
(M&E)/Assistant Director (Labs)/Assistant Director
(Projects), who possesses Degrae of B.Tech
{tions) or Diploma of Associate Engineering from
a recognized WUniversity/ Board with five years’
.service as such,” .

.|:Note: For the purpose of promotion, joint
seniority-of B.Tech (Hens) & Diplama holders shalt
be reckoned from thé date of promotion to
BPS-17,

{i§)  against serial No.04, in column No.05,

(a)  in clause (a), for the words “Five percent”, the words "Two percent” shali
be substituted;

(b) in clause (b), for the words “Five percent”, the words “Three percent”
- shall be substituted; _

(¢)  in clause (c), for the wards “Three percent”, the words “Eight percen
shaf} be substituted; and :

(dy  after clause (c), as so amended, the following Note shaﬂ be Inserted:
namely: .

“"Note:for the purpose of promotion, the seniority of B.Tech {Hons)
Degree holders shall be reckoned from the date of appointment or
acquiring the Degree, whichever is later; and

(2) Under the heading "Water Quafity (WQ) Laboratory’s Technical Staff":

(i) agalnst Serial No,26, in column. No.05, for the existing entry, the following shall
be substituted, namely:

of the post of Research Omcer‘{Waterbuan)_ with five years service as such.”

By promotion, on the basis: of seniority-cum-fitiess, from amongst the holders l

@ CamScanncr




L}
-

(i)  against Serial No.28, in column No.05, for the existing entry, the following shall Q.uv-r
be substituted, namely:

@Y Tuerty fve prcent by pramotien, o e Dot e eott ere
from amongst the holders of the post of La.bora_olfy or Chemistry
possess at least second class B.Sc Degree in Microbiclogy

from a recognized University, with 5-years service as such; and \
; \

(b) Seventy-five percent by initial recruitment. \\

(ili}  after Serial No.28, the following new entries shall be inserted, in the respective \
Columns, namely;

"28-A | Laboratory | At Ieast Second 18 t0 30 | (a) Twenty-five  percent . by
Asslstant Oivisian Secondary [ years promotion, on the basis of
(BPS-08) &ﬂﬁ!gtﬂﬁiﬁ;ﬁ seniority-cum-fitness,  from

?gnnaremgn}zed amongst the holders of the
Board with two yesrs post of Laboratory Technician
193'}‘1“?; fn 'r-abﬂra“”? with 5-years service as such.
aldan fmm a
;m?l’;“e" Medical (b) Seventy-five percent by initial
acuity.

recruitment; and

, (iv)  Agalnst Serial No.29, in Column No.05, for the existing entry,

the following shall '
. be substituted namely:

( (a) FiRy percent by promotion, on the basis of senlority-cum

-fitness, from
amongst the holders of the Post of Laboratory Attendant w

ho possess at

ty, with S-years,
service as such; and .
s , )

?. e
;; -(b}"* Fifty percent by initial recruitment.
: )

| _ ]

SECRETARY TO
GOVY; OF KHYBER PAKHTUNKHwWA
"PUBLIC HEALTH ENGG: DEPARTMENT

PHED/1- 0:21; Dated Peshawar, the 31 /01 /2022
Copy forwarded to the:- :

1) All Administrative Secretarles to Govt. of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa.
2) Secretary to Governor Khyber Pakhtunkhwa, . .

3) Princpai Secretary to Chlef Minlster Khyber Pakhtunkhwa.
4) Accountant Genera! Khyber Pakhtunkhwa,

5) Chlef Engtneer (North/South/East/Center PHE Khitber Pakhtunkhw,

6) Registrar Peshawar High Court-/ Servica Tribuna) Peshawar.

t Khyber Pakhtunkhwa,

a Peshawar,

7) All Superintending Engineers PHE / XENs PHE.Departmen
8} Manager Government Stationary & Printing Department,
9) PS to Chlef Secretary Khyber Pakhtu /An

10} PS to Secretary PHE
11) Office Order Flie,

SECTION FF_ICER (ESTT)

| Admiplstrative Ofﬁcﬁ‘ré )
! 010 the Lliel Engineer (C?J e @ -
‘; Pubtic Hewlih Engineenng. -

Khyber pakhiunkhwa, Peshawar

Il




1

AR 7~ @

OFFICE OF CHIEF ENGINEER (CENTER)

PUBLIC HEALTH ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT

NO_}'IFICATION
' KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA PESHAWAR
_In pursuance of Section-8 (5) of the NWFP Civil Servants act 1973, the Final seniority list of B.E/BS.c (Civil/Electronic) in Service Graduate
Sub Engineers {BPS-16 & 12) of Public Health Engg: Department Khyber Pakhtunkhwa, As it stood on 31.12.2023 is notified as detail below.
Date of Date of Year of Acquiring
S.No Name Father Name (Home District| Date of Birth Commencement | Appointment to Degree of Remarks
of Serivce Present Post BS¢(Civil/Elect)
o
1 |ljaz Ahmad Sana Ullah FR Bannu 05.03.1992 21.03.2017 09.03.2017 14.09.2021] Promoted a SDO
2 |Muhammad Riaz Taslim Khan Khyber 04.09.1991 10.11.2015 29.10.2015 24.07.2023
3 |Umer Faroog Asif Farooq Karak 08.05.1991 02.03.2012 10.01.2018 10.11.2023
=

Endstt: No. Og/C 6’ - /3 Dated Peshawar the

Copy of the Seniority List is forwarded for information to the: -
1 - Chief Engineer (North/South/East) Public Health Engg: Department Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Peshawar.
2 - All Superintending Engineers in Public Health Engg: Department Center/North/South/East Khyber Pakhtunkhwa.

3 - All Executive Engineers in Public Health Engg: Department Center/North/South/East Khyber Pakhtunkhwa.
4 - Section Officer (Estt) Public Health Engg: Department Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Peshawar

Public Health Engineering Deptt:
Khyber Pakhtunkhwa, Peshawar

ey _QL; 2024

Chief Engineer (Genter)

iRy

Adminiktrative Officer (Center)




Ry - Anne s D
d . f}. ua R N 9_-.:

GOVERNMENT OF KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA
PUBLIC HEALTH ENGG: DEPARTMENT

- Dated Peshawar, the May 31, 2024

NOTIFICATION

O(E '4:53-B/20 D0; On the recommendations of
Departmental Promotion Committee, the competent authority is pleased to promote Mr. ljaz
Ahmad, In-Service Graduate B.E/BSc (Civil) Sub Engineer (BPS-12) Public Health Engg: Division,
Karak to the post of Assistant Engineer/Assistant Design Engineer/Sub Divisional
Officer/Assistant Technical officer (BPS-17) on regular basis, with immediate effect.

2. The officer, on promaotion, will réemain on probatzon for a period of one year in
terms of Rule-15 of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa, Civil Servants {Appointment, Promotion & Transfer)
Rules, 1989,

3 - The posﬁng]transf;er'of'theiabuvefn_am'ed officer will follow.

SECRETARY
PHE DEPARTMENT

' Cupy forwarded for mfnrmation and necessary action to the
1. Accountant General Khyber Pakhtunkhwa.
2. All Chief Engineers PHE Department Peshawar,
3. All Superintending Engineers PHE Circles, PHE Department.
4. Executive Engineer PHE Division, Karak & Hangu. :
S. District Accounts Officer, Karak & Hangu.
6. Assistant Director, 1.T PHE Department, -
7. PS to Chief Secretary Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Peshawar.
B. PS to Minister for PHE Khyber Pakhtunhwa.
3. PS to Secretary PHE Department, Peshawar.
10. PA to Additional Secretary PHE Department, Peshawar.
11, PS to Deputy Secretary-I & II, PHE Department, Peshawar.
12. Officers/officials concerned.
13. Office Order / Personal Files.

e

p ' sec:rxom OFFICER (ESTT)

rative Officer

ter)
Ol0the G :}f Engineer (Cen

Public Heag Engineering Deptt
tunkhwa, Peshawar




Anetpe=£

GOVERNMENT OF KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA
PUBLIC HEALTH ENGG: DEPARTMENT

Dated Peshawar, the Auqust 28, 2024

NOTIFICATION

No.SO D/4-53-B/2024/SDQ; Consequent upon the promotion
of Mr. Jjaz Ahmad, Sub Engineer (BS-12) to the post of Assistant Engineer /Sub
Divisional Officer (BS-17) on regular basis and in continuation of this department’s
notification of even No. dated 31.05.2024 and in order to actualize his promotion, the
competent authority is pleased to order the following postings/transfers and adjustments
of the officer/official of the Public Health Engg: Department, in the best interest of public
service:

S# Name From To

1. | Engr. Ijaz Ahmad jSub Engineer PHE Division, | SDO PHE Sub-Division, Karak-I.
(BS-17) Karak-1

2. [ Mr.Umar Farooq | SDO (OPS) PHE Sub-Division, | Sub Engineer PHE Division,
(BS-12) Karak-I. Karak-1.

SECRETARY to GOVT. of KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA
PUBLIC HEATH ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT

Endst: No. & dated as above,

Copy forwarded for information and necessary action to the:
Chief Engineers (South & Center) PHE Department Peshawar.
Superintending Engineer PHE Circle, Kohat.

Executive Engineer PHE Division, Karak & Hangu.

District Accounts Officer, Karak & Hangu.

Assistant Director, I.T PHE Department.

PS to Chief Secretary Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Peshawar.

PS to Minister for PHE Khyber Pakhtunhwa.

PS to Secretary PHE Department, Peshawar.

PA to Additional Secretary PHE Department, Peshawar.

10 PS to Deputy Secretary-I & II, PHE Department, Peshawar.
11. Officer/official concerned.

12. Office Order / Personal F;Ies.ﬂ % 28 /g .
Af ; / (KT LAH)
W ] SECTIQMGHFICER (ESTT)
1CET

O/0 the Chiff|Engineer (Center)
Public Health\engineering Deptt:
Khyber Pakhtunkhwa, Peshawar

WONOUN AW

pr—

Ptada !
fomew CamScanner



